
 
 

 

Invitation to the 5th LifeSaving.nl Pool Meeting 

For the fifth consecutive year, LifeSaving.nl is organizing a pool-competition. The 
annual LifeSaving.nl Pool Meeting is progressively becoming a well-known 
international competition, where lots of Dutch and European top athletes compete. 
This year’s competition is going to take place on Saturday the 13th of July in the new 
Hofbad in The Hague, a brand new state-of-the-art 50m pool with all the proper 
ingredients for fast times, including a separate warmup/cooldown pool and electronic 
timekeeping. 

This year, the organization has teamed up with the organizing committee of the 
European Championships 2013. This makes this edition of the Pool Meeting the 
official Test Event for the 2013 EC. Technical officials and volunteers will use the 
LifeSaving.nl Pool Meeting as opportunity to warm up for the European 
Championships, which will be held from the 16th to the 18th of August in The Hague 
and Noordwijk. 

Entering this competition is possible until Saturday June 29th, at 8 pm. The entry form 
needs to be filled out completely and correctly and has to be sent to 
martin.teley@lifesaving.nl. The entry form is digitally available at the websites 
http://lifesaving.nl and http://www.eklifesaving.nl. More information, like the entry 
fees, age groups, information about the classifications and the concept program for 
the competition day are also available on these websites. 

This year, we want to offer all competitors and companions the possibility to use an 
overnight stay for roughly €30,- p.p.p.n. including breakfast. This way, it is possible  
for you to arrive Friday evening or Saturday morning and stay until Sunday. 
Therefore, the organization of the EC 2013 has made an agreement with NH Hotel 
Zoetermeer. If you are interested in taking up this offer, please contact us before 20th 
March 2013 via email for exact pricing and availability. 

We hope to be able to welcome a lot of competitors on Saturday, July 13th, in the 
Hofbad in The Hague. 

 

Kind regards, 

The LifeSaving.nl team & The EC organization committee 
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